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I In the village breakup at para B-2.3 online purt-t tt 
" 

,-orrr. of
village are mentioned as Lalnagri and Basalnal Gaon while the
village level committee proceeding is provided onry for the
Lalnagri. The state government may also provide VLC
proceeding for the village Basanal Gaon and upload the same at
para K, Online Part&I as annexure of FRA certificate.
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2 In the digital map of the proposed area uploaded ut puraClffl
part-I of online in google earth image and does not derve any
useful purpose. May upload GIS software is generated GEI
refference Digital map of the area proposed for diversion
providing GEO coordinate of 200rntrs-300mtrs. Along the
proposed alignment of the turns. Original hard copy of this may
also be providing .
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J In para K online part I the FRA certificate issred by OC is not
found uploaded with all annexures regarding district lever
committee proceding sub divisional level committee and village
level committee proceding which are uploaded in additionar
document in online part-I. The state goverrunent may upload the
FRA certificate with all amexures at para K online part I the
date of FRA Certificate issued by district collector may be also
mentiones.
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4 All the documents available in the hard copy in the proposal as

photocopies and not the original document state gor,t may
provided hard copy of the proposal folder containing area
original or attested copies of the documents. However the FRA
certificate and the GEO reference digital map of proposed road
and CA should be in original.
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