
"f)iversion of 186.96 ha of Reserved Forest Land for acquisition of forest land for the

proposed Bhadbhut Barrage Proiect across River Narmada near Bhadbhut Village in
Bharuch district in favour of Executive Engineer, Gulf of Kharnbhat Development
Project (WR) Project Implementation lJnit-2, Vadodara, Gujarat".

GoI, MoEF' & CC, New Delhi Letter No.8-50/2017-FC Dt. 2111212017 MoEIr
(Principle approval)

Sr.
No

Details of Conditions Action taken Remarks

1 Legal status of the diverted
forest land shall remain

unchanged.

Noted.

2 Compensatory afforestation
shall be raised over 186.96ha
non-forest land. The
plantation shall be carried out
by planting 1000 plants per ha

( 186.96 hectares x
1000:186960 plants) with in
a period of 3 year from the
date of Stage-II approval at

the cost of User Agency. If it
is not possible to plant all
186960 plants over the given
non forest land then the left
over plants shall be planted
over degraded forest land as

per working plan prescription.

Compensatory afforestation
has been processed on E-
portal as per prescribed
procedure/norms laid.
Compensatory afforestation
shall be duly done.

3 Approved CAT plan for the
area shall be submitted prior
to stage II. The respective cost
of CAT plan shall be

deposited in the account of

Approved the Catchment
Area Treatment (CAT) Plan
vide letter No.
KLP/l Q20161335/ Kalpasar
dated 1311012017 has been



Ad-hoc CAMPA of the
concerned State through
online portal.

submitted. Copy of this letter
is attached as ANNEXURE-
L

4 Compliance of Scheduled
Tribe and Other Traditional
Forest Dwellers (Recognition
of Forest Rights) Act, 2006
for 187.00 ha of forest land
has not been submitted in
prescribe format along with
the supporting documents.
The complete compliance of
the FRA 2006 shall be

submitted at the time of final
approval (Stage-II) approval.

No such schedule tribe and
other traditional forest
dwellers exists in 187 ha

land, accordingly
compliance of FRA 2006 is
submitted herewith as

ANNEXURE-II.

5 It is reported in Site
inspection report that there are

24454 trees. Prosopis is the
main species. DSS analysis
and report of State Forest
Department suggests that
babool trees are in plenty and
at places mangrove species

are spotted. Accordingly,
State Government shall take
utmost care to allow, only
minimum numbers of trees

which is unavoidable, to be

fe11ed.

Utmost care shall be taken
by in such a way that only
minimum numbers of trees

in unavoidable circumstance
shall be removed during
course of execution of
Bhadbhut Barrage Project.

6 The permission from National
Coastal Zone Management
Authority (NCZMA) shall be

obtained wherever applicable.
The mangrove will be
managed as per the existing
guidelines.

The permission from the
Gujarat Coastal Zone
Management Authority
(GCZMA), authority having
jurisdiction, has been
obtained vide letter dated

3110812017. Copy is attached

herewith as ANNEXURE-
IIr.



1 For the protection of aquatic
fauna parallel channel along
the river will be made. A
comprehensive study shall be

conducted by the state

government and submitted
before the Stage-II approval
and the same will be

implemented at the cost of the

user agency. The NOC from
the wildlife department may
be obtained before execution
of the project.

User Agency (Kalpasar
Department, Government of
Gujarat) has appointed
NEERI, Nagpur and CIFRI,
Kolkata for conducting
comprehensive study for
protection of aquatic fauna.

A11 the approved Interim and

Final Reports submitted by
NEERI, Nagpur and CIFRI,
Kolkata shall be submitted
before Stage-II approval and

same shall be implemented
at the cost of the User
Agency.

The NOC from the Wildlife
Department shall also be

obtained before execution of
the Bhadbhut Barrage
Project if applicable.

8 The non-forest land identified
for raising compensatory
afforestation shall be

transferred and mutated in
favour of the State Forest
Department before issue of
the Stage-II clearance.

Land identified for
Compensatory afforestation
has been transferred and

mutated in favor of the state

Forest Department 31-40-00
Ha at Tol Saladi Chotili of
Taluka Jesar in Dist
Bhavnagar and 157-34-24
Ha at Nani Dhufi Ta:
Abadasa in Kachchh
District. Total 188-14-24 H.
Are. Sqmt Land handed over
to Forest Department for
Compensatory afforestation.



9 Non-forest land to be

transferred and mutated in
favour of the State Forest

Department for raising
Compensatory Afforestation
shall be notified as reserved

Forest under Setion-4 or
Protected Forest under
Section-29 of the Indian
Forest Act, 1927 or under the
relevant Section(s) of the local
Forest Act;

Necessary action shall be

taken by concerned State

Forest Department office as

per Indian Forest Act-7921
or under the relevant
Section(s) of the local Forest

Act as applicable.

10 The land identified for the
purpose of CA shall be clearly
depicted on a Survey of India
topo sheet of 1:50,000 scale;

The land identified for the
purpose Compensatory
Afforestation has been

depicted on a Survey of
India (SOD topo sheet of
1:50,000 scale. Copy of the

Sheet is attached as

ANNEXURE.IV.

11 The User Agency shall
transfer the cost of raising and
maintaining the compensatory
afforestation at the current
wagg rate in consultation with
State Forest Department in the

account of Ad-hoc CAMPA
of the concerned State through
online portal. The scheme

may include appropriate
provision for anticipated cost
increase for works scheduled
for subsequent years.

The Kalpasar Department
(User Agency) has

transferred the cost of raising
and maintaining the

Compensatory Afforestation
at the current wage rate in
consultation with the Gujarat
State Forest Department.
Rs.22,39,60,3241- (CA- Rs.

5,90,91,3241_ + NPV Rs.

| 6,58,69,000/-) is transferred
in the account of Ad-hoc
GUJARAT CAMPA of the

concerned State through
online E-Portal on 03-03-
2018. Copy of such

transaction has been attached

herewith as ANNEXURE-
v.



12 The User Agency shall

transfer the funds for the Net
Present Value (NPV) of the
forest land being diverted
under this proposal from the

User Agency as per the orders

of the Hon'ble Supreme Court
of India dated 28.03.2008,
24.04.2408 and 09.05.2008 in
Writ Petition (Civil)
No.202l1995 and the
guidelines issued by this
Ministry vide its letter No. 5-

312007 -FC dated A5.02.2009

through online portal of Ad-
hoc CAMPA account of the

State Concerned.

The NPV for the forest land
for Rs. 16.5869 Crore, Cost

of scheme of Government
Land transferred to Forest

offices in Kachchh &
Bhavnagar districts for
Rs.4.96 Crore. Rs.0.84 Crore
respectively has been

deposited through e-portal.

13 At the time of payment of the

Net Present Value (NPV) at

the then prevailing rate, the

User Agency shall furnish an

undertaking to pay the

additional amount of NPV, if
so determined, as per the final
decision of the Hon'ble
Supreme Court of India;

Necessary undertaking to
pay the additional amount by
the User Agency (Kalpasar
Department, Government of
Gujarat) is attached herewith
as ANNEXURE VI.

t4 Any fund received form the

user agency under the project,

except the funds realized for
regeneration/ demarcation of
safety zone, shall be

transferred to Ad-hoc
CAMPA through online portal
of Ad-hoc CAMPA account

of the State Concerned;

Noted and shall be foilowed.

15 The User Agency shall
provide fuels preferably
alternate fuels to the labourers
and the staff working at the

Noted and shail be followed.



site so as to avoid any damage

and pressure on the nearby
forest areas;

l6 The boundary of the diverted
forest land, mining lease and

safety zone, as applicable,
shall be demarcated on ground

at the project cost, by erecting
four feet high reinforced
cement concrete pillars, each

inscribed with its serial

number, forward and back
bearing, distance from pillar
to pillar and GPS co-ordinate;

Noted and shal1 be followed.
Table incorporating details is

attached herewith as

ANNEXURE.VII.

t1 The layout plan of the
proposal shall not be changed

without the prior approval of
the Central Government;

Noted and shall be followed.

18 The forest land shall not be

used for any purpose other
than that specified in the
proposal;

Noted and shall be followed.

t9 The forest land proposed to be

diverted shall under no

circumstances be transferred
to any other agency,

department or person without
prior approval of the Central
Government;

Noted and shall be followed.

20 The State Government shall
maintain the character of the
project as an irrigation project
and to ensure continued
benefit to the farmers in the

command area;

The proposed project is not
under an exclusive category
of the Irrigation Project.

21 The water shall be provided
form the reservoir to the

Forest Department for raising

Noted and shall be followed.



and maintenance of
plantations and nurseries

around the site whenever
required, free of charge. The
quantity and time of supply of
water shall be as decided by
the Forest Department.

22 The User Agency shall
undertake afforestation along
the periphery of the reservoir
and canals (as applicable).

Noted. The User Agency
shall undertake afforestation
along the periphery of the

reservoir as applicable.

23 The User Agency shall carry
out muck disposal at pre-

designated sites in such a

manner so as to avoid its
rolling down.

Noted and shall be followed.

24 The dumping area for muck
disposal shall be stabilized
and reclaimed by planting
suitable species by the User
Agency at the cost of project
under the supervision of State

Forest Department. Retaining
walls and terracing shall be

carried out to hold the

dumping material in place.

Stabilization and reclamation

of such dumping sites shall be

completed before handing
over the same to the State

Forest Department in a time
bound manner as per Plan.

Noted and shall be followed.
Necessary provisions shall
be made under the technical
specifications of the Tender
Documents to be prepared

for Bhadbhut Barrage
Project during detailed
engineering by the User
Agency (Kaipasar

Department, Government of
Gujarat).

25 The user agency shall
implement the R&R Policy of
State Government in
consonance with National
R&R Policy, Government of
India before the

commencement of the project

Aspresent,R&Risnot
applicable for Bhadbhut
Barrage Project.

However, the User Agency
(Kalpasar Department,

Government of Gujarat)



work. The said R&R Plan will
be monitored by the State

Government/concerned
Regional Office of
MoEF&CC along with
indicators for monitoring and
expected observable
milestones.

shall follow the said

directions in case R&R issue
is required to be dealt with.

26 The State Government and the
User Agency shall ensure that
the trees available between
full reservoir level (FRL) and
FRL-4 meters are not felled;

Noted and shall be followed.
The State Government and

the User Agency ( Kalpasar
Department, Government of
Gujarat ) shall take due care

that the trees available
between fulI reservoir level
(FRL) and FRL-4 meters are

not felled.

27 The User Agency shall submit
the annual self-compliance
report in respect of the above
conditions to the State

Government and to the
concerned Regional Office of
the Ministry regularly:

Noted and shall be followed.
The User Agency (Ifulpasar
Department, Government of
Gujarat) shall submit the
annual self-compliance
report in respect of the above

conditions to the State

Government and to the
concerned Regional Office
of the Ministry regularly.

28 Any other condition that the
concerned Regional Office of
this Ministry may stipulate,
from time to time, in the
interest of conservation,
protection and development of
forest & wildlife; and

Any other conditions other
than stipulated by the
concerned Regional Office
of the Ministry from time to
time, in the interest of
conservation, protection and
development of forest &
wildlife shall be honored and
followed by the User
Agency (Kalpasar
Department, Government of
Gujarat).



29 The User Agency and the

State Government shall ensure

compliance to provisions of
the all Acts, Rules,

Regulations, Guidelines, NGT
order(s) and relevant Hon'ble
Court Order (s), if dny,
pertaining to this project for
the time being in force, as

applicable to the project.

Noted and shall be followed.

30 User Agency should ensure

that the Compensatory levies
(CA cost, NPV, etc.) are

deposited through challan
generated online on web
portal and deposited in
appropriate bank online only.
Amount deposited through
other mode will not be

accepted as compliance of the

Stage-I clearance.

User Agency (Kalpasar

Department, Government of
Gujarat) has deposited the

Compensatory levies
Rs.22,39,60,3241- (CA cost -

Rs. 5,90,91,3241_ + NPV Rs.

16,58,69,0001 etc.) through
challan generated online on

web portal and deposited in
appropriate bank online on

0310312018. Copy of Challan
of such online transaction is
attached as ANNEXURE-V.
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Gulf of Khambliat Development Project(WR)
Proj ect Implementation Unit-2
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Executive Engin..r.
Gulf of Khambhat Development Project(WR)

Proj ect Implementation Unit-2
Vadodala



ANNExTJ(E- L

No, KLP/102016/335/Kalpsar

N,W.R.W.S. & K, Deptt

Block No. 8/7, New Sachivalay

Gandhinagar

Dt. lL0/2077

1 3 oCT 2017

To,
//,/

\/ Superintending Engineer
, Project lmplementation Unit No.2

Vadodara

approved,

5ub : Environmental approval to forest land for 187 hectors
- Approval to catchment area treatment plan for Bhadbhut Barrage

Project

Ref. : Your office letter No. PIU-2lPB-2lOnline Forest/464 of 2017, Dt.
1- /^ /-^a 

-zri:.'i/_v!t _

Catchment Area Treatment Plan submitted vide letter under reference is hereby

-s.ok
Under Secretary {Tech)
N.W.R.W.S, & K, Deptt.

Gandhinagar

\,-:ir'

.g. E-q d-")
(*

.'-i-i:
r_ -i

.'--....--.'..1"-,.
,. l

i , i.",, :
-._,....-....___-,-,- :,...



KALPASAR DEPARTMENT
(coveRNMENT oF GUJARAT)

CATCHMENT AREA TREATMENT STUDY FOR
BHADBHUT BARRAGE PROJECT, GUJARAT

CAT REPORT

.4 qrdz+ftffi
W WAPCOS LrMt'rEL)
,:r. ","" 
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WAPGOS LIMITED
(A Government of lndia Undertaking)

76 C, Sector 18, Gurgaon - 122015, Haryana, INDIA
Tel. 0124 2397396, Fax. 0124 2397392
Email: environment@wapcos.co.in

DEGEMBER 2017



CATCHMENT AREA TREATMENT PLAN

CATCHMENT AREA TREATNIENT - INTRODUCTION

It is a well-established fact that reservoirs formed by darns and barrages on rivers are subjected

to sedimentation. The process of sedimentation embodies the sequential processes of erosion,

entrainment, transpofiation, deposition and compaction of sediment. The study of erosion and

sediment yield from catchments is of utmost imporlance as the deposition of sedirnent in

reservoir reduces its capacity, and thus affecting the water availability for the designated use.

The eroded sediment from catchment when deposited on streambeds and banks causes braiding

of river reach. The removal of top ferlile soil from catchment adversely atfects the agricultural

production. Thus, a well-designed Catchment Area Treatment (CAT) Plan is essential to

ameliorate the above-mentioned adverse process of soil erosion Soil erosion mav be detjned as

the detachment and transpoftation of soil. Water is the major agent responsible tbr this erosicrit.

In many locations, winds, glaciers, etc. also cause soil erosion. ln a hi11y catchment area. as i:r

the present case erosion due to water is a common phenomenon and the same iras been studied .rs

a parl of the Catchrnent Area Treatment (CAT) Plan. The Catchment Area Treatment (C.\T) p1.1.

highlights the management techniques to control erosion in the catchment area. Lrte span oi "
reservoir in case of a seasonal storage dams and bar:rages is greatly reduced due to erosion in the

catchment area.

The catchment area intercepted at the Bhadbhut barrage site is 8,660.48 km2 in the downstream

of the Sardar Sarovar Project. Water availability has also been computed as per the intercepted

catchment area though the spillover discharge from the Sardar Sarovar Darn is going to augment

the designed water availability.

As Sardar Sarovar Dam has been constructed much earlier, detailed study for the entire basin

have been carried out which have led to a compilation of very useful and essenti al data and the

same has been used here for the extension of the work.

The catchment area keatment involves -

. Understanding of the erosion characteristics of the terrain



o Suggesting remedial measures to reduce the erosion rate

In the present study'Silt Yield lndex' (SYD, method has been used. In this method, the terrain is

subdivided into various watersheds and the erodibility is determined on relative basis. SYI

provides a comparative erodibility criteria of catchment (low, moderate, high, etc.) and do not

provide the absolute silt yield. SYI method is widely used mainly because of the fact that it is

easy to use and has lesser data requirement. Moreover, it can be applied to larger areas like sub-

watersheds, etc.

Annual water availability at75o/o dependability is 1648.25 MCM. Storage of fresh river water of

approximately 600 MCM for meeting domestic and industrial water supply has been designed.

Controlling salinity ingress and deterioration of ground water quality in upper reaches of

Narmada has been the main objective.

Figure - I Basin Map of Lower Reach of Narmada
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Figure - 2 Narmada Basin Map in the Downstream of Sardar Sarovar Project

Table - 1

Bescription of various sub-b**ins in free catchrment helotn S$P

Suh-basin IDX

Color
$uh-basin

Araa {sq. krn}
$ub-b*sin des,eription

581 3il5 S1 Area of Sr:khi derrn catchnr*nt utithin {-it-liar*t Stat*,

.>t1 Ii:l ')tr a} Area of Sukhidam c"atchment within h.'lP State

SB2 28tsS"$"r
Area of Orslrng +atchn:ent belcw Sukht derm ivithtn
fiujarat State.

btrllt ss8-fi6 Area of Orsang catchment bsi*w Silkhi dam withirl
l\4P "ltate

sB3 1372 Area of Karjan dem eatcil-rment within Gtljerat .Stute-

SBSa 31
Area of Karjen dam catchment wiihfli il'taharashtrar
LA LLI tE -

584 3'177 1
,Aren of ffee eatctment below SSP, Sukhidan:,
ldcrjxr: denr. and Ors*nE cetehn'rent up t* Bhadbhut

APPROACH FOR TI{E STUDY

A detailed database on natural resources, terrain conditions, soil type of the catchment area,

socio-economic status, etc. is a pre-requisite to prepare treatment plan keeping in view the

concept of sustainable development. Various thematic maps have been used in preparation of the

CAT plan. Due to the spatial variability of site parameters such as soils, topography, land use



and rainfall, not all areas contribute equally to the erosion problem. Several techniques like

manual overlay of spatially index-mapped data have been used to estimate soil erosion in

complex landscapes. Geographic Information System (GIS) is a computeizedresource data base

system, which is referenced to some geographic coordinate system. In the present sfudy, real

coordinate system has been used. The GIS is a tool to store, analyze and display various spatial

data. In addition, GIS because of its special hardware and software characteristics, has a capacity

to perform numerous functions and operations on the various spatial data layers residing in the

database. GIS provides the capability to analyze large amounts of data in relation to a set of
established criteria. In order to ensure that latest and accurate data is used for the analysis,

satellite data has been used for deriving land use data and ground truth studies too have been

conducted. The various steps covered in the study are as follows:

o Data acquisition

Data preparation

o Output presentation

The requirement of the study was first defined and the outputs expected were noted. The various

data layers of the catchment area used for the study are as follows:

. Slope Map

. Soil Map

o Land use Classification Map

o Curent Management Practices

e Catchment Area Map

The data available from various sources was collected. The ground maps, contour information,

etc. were scanned, digitized and registered as per the requirement. Data was prepared depending

on the level of accuracy required and any corrections required were made. A11 the layers were

geo-referenced and brought to a common scale (real coordinates), so that overlay could be

performed. A computer programme was used to estimate the soil loss. The formats of outputs

from each layer were firmed up to match the formats of inputs in the program. The grid size to be

used was also decided to match the level of accuracy required, the data availability and the

software and time limitations. The format of output was finalized. Ground truthing and data



collection was also included in the procedure. For the present study Resourcesat-2 LISS III

digital satellite data was used for interpretation and classification.

Table - 2
Landuse pattern of the catchment area

Category Area in km2

Dense Vegetation tt4t.57

Open Vegetation 1388.18

Barren/ Open Land 250.85

Agricultural Land 4785.58

River/ Water Bod-v 1 18.3s

Settlements 969.9s

Total 8,660.48

ESTIMATION OF SOIL LOSS USING SILT YIELD INDEX (SYD METHOD

The Silt Yield Index Model (SYD, considering sedimentation as product of erosivity, erodibility

and arial extent was conceptlualized in the All India Soil and Land Use Survey (AISLUS) as

early as 1969 and has been in operational use since then to meet the requirements of
prioritization of smaller hydrologic units. The erosivity determinants are the climatic factors and

soil and land attributes that have direct or reciprocal bearing on the unit of the detached soil

material. The relationship can be expressed as:

Soil erosivity : f (Climate, physiography, slope, soil parameters, land use/land cover, soil

management)

SiIt Yield Index

The Silt Yield Index (SYD is defined as the Yield per unit area and SYI value for hydrologic unit

is obtained by taking the weighted arithmetic mean over the entire area of the hydrologic unit by

using suitable empirical equation.

Prioritization of Watersheds/Subwatersheds

The prioritization of smaller hydrologic units within the vast catchments are based on the Silt

Yield Indices (SYD of the smaller units. The boundary values or range of SYI values for



ditl-erent priority categories arc arrived at by studying the t}equency distribution of SYI values

and locating the suitable breaking points. The watersheds/ sub-watersheds are subsequently rated

into various categories coffesponding to their respective SYI values. The application of SYI

model tbr prioritization of sub ',vatersheds irr the catchrnent areas involves the evaluation of:

a) Climatic factors comprising total precipitation" its fiequency and intensity

b) Geomorphic factors comprising land fbrms, physiography, slope and drainage characteristics

c) Surface cover f'actors goveming the tlow hydraulics

d) Management factors.

The data on climatic factors can be obtained fbr dift'erent locations in the catchment area from

the meteorological stations whereas the fleld investigations are required for estimating the other

attributes. The various steps involved in the application of model are:

- Preparation of a tiame'uvork of sub-watersheds through systematic delineation

- Rapid reconnaissance surveys on l:50,000 scale leacling to the generation of a map indicating

erosion-intensity mapping units.

- Assignment of weightage values to various mapping units based on relative silt-yield potential.

- Computing Silt Yield Index lbr individual watersheds/sub watersheds.

- Grading of rvatersheds/sub watelsheds into very high, high medium, low and very low priority

categories.

The area of each of the mapping units is computed and silt yield indices of individual sub

watersheds are calculated using the following equations:

a. Silt Yield Index

SYI : I (Ai x Wi ) x 100 ;

where i : 1 to n Aw Where Ai : Area of ith unit (EIMU) Wi : Weightage value of ith mapping

unit

n: No. of mapping units Aw: Total area of sub-watershed.

The SYI values for classif,rcation of various categories of erosion intensity rates are given in

Table - 3.



Priority Categories SYI Value
Very hieh > 1300

Hieh DAA-t299
Medium 1 100-1 199

Low 1000-1099
Very Low <1000

Table - 3

Criteria for erosion intensity rate

WATERSHED MANAGEMENT _ AVAILABLE TECHNIQUES

Watershed management is the optimal use of soil and water resources within a given

geographical area so as to enable sustainable production. It implies changes in land use,

vegetative cover, and other structural and non-structural action that are taken in a watershed to

achieve specific watershed management objectives. The overall objectives of watershed

management programme are to:

- increase infiltration into soil; - control excessive runoff

- Manage and utilize runoff for useful purpose

Following Engineering and Biological measures have been suggested for the catchment area

treatment.

1. Engineering measures

- Step drain

- Angle iron barbed wire fencing

- Stone masoffy

- Check dams

2. Biological measures

- Development of nurseries

- Plantation/afforestation

- Pasture development

- Social forestry



The basis of site selection for different biological and engineering treatment measures under

CAT is the final objective. Basis for selection of catchment area treatment measures Treatment

measure Basis for selection Social forestry, fuel wood and fodder grass development Near

settlements to control tree felling Contour Bunding Control of soil erosion from agricultural

fields. Pasture Development Open canopy, barren land, degraded surface Afforestation Open

canopy, degraded surface, high soil erosion, gentle to moderate slope Barbed wire fencing In the

vicinity of afforestation work to protect it from grazingetc.

Step drain to check soil erosion in small streams, steps with concrete base are prepared in sloppy

area rvhere silt erosion in the stream and bank erosion is high due to turbidity of current. Nursery

Centrally located points for better supervision of proposed afforestation, minimize cost of
transportation of seedling and ensure better survival.

Table - 4

Basis for selection of catchment area treatment measures

Treatment measure Basis for selection
Social forestry, fuel weod and
fodder erass development

Near settlements to control tree felting

Contour Bundino Control of soil erosion from agricultural fielcls.
Pasture Development Cpen canopv. barren land, degraded surface
Afforestation Open canopy, degraded surface, high sail erssion"

qentle io moderate slspe
Barbed wire fencing ln tlre vicinity of afforestation work to protect it from

grazing etc.

Step drain To check soil erosion in small streams, steps with
ccncrete base are prepared ir: sloppy area where silt
erosion in the stream and hank ero=ion is high due to
turbiditv of current.

Nursery Centrally focated paints for better supervision of
propcsed afforestation, rninirnize cost of transportation
of seedlinq and ensure better survival.

CATCHMENT AREA TREATMENT MEASURES

The total catchment area is 8,660.48 km2. The erosion category of various watersheds in the

catchment area as per a SYI index is given in Table - 5.



Table - 5

Eros ion intensity categorization as per SYI classificl tion
Watershed Number Area in km2 SYI value Category

SB1 38s.91 1110 Medium

SBla 25.9 1 050 Low

SB2 2699.91 tt70 Medium

SB2a 968.66 t230 Hish

SB3 t372 1020 Low

SB3a 31 t020 Low

SB4 3117.t 1 130 Medium

COST ESTIMATE

Measure Year-1 Year-Z Year-3 Total

Physical Financial Physical Financial Physical Financial Physical Financial

Gap

Plantation

60 ha Rs. 15

Lack

90 ha Rs. 22

Lack

60 ha Rs. 15

Lack

2l0ha Rs. 52

Lack

Allbrestation 40 ha Rs. 40

Lack

40 ha Rs. 40

Lack

Nursery
development

2 No. Rs. 40

Lack

2 No. Rs. 40

Lack

Maintenance
ol
nursery

Barbed r,vire

lbncing
3km Rs. 15

Lack

3 krn Rs. 15

Lack

Watch and
ward for 3

years for 5
persons

36 man

month

Rs. 3.6

Lack

36 man

month

Rs. 3.6

Lack

36 man

month

Rs. 3.6

Lack

108 man

month

Rs. 10.8

Lack

Contour
bunding

6 No. Rs. 6 Lack 8 No. Rs. 8 Lack 14 No. Rs. 14

Lack

Check dam 4 No. Rs. 8 Lack 4 No. Rs. 8 Lack 4 No. Rs. 8 Lack 12 No. Rs. 24

Lack

Total Rs. 81.6

Lack

Rs. 41.6

Lack

Rs. 66.6

Lack

Rs. 195.8

Lack
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WAPCOS LIMITED
(A Governmentof lhdia Undertaking)

76 C, Sector 18, Gurgaon 122q15, Har,yana
website : www.wapcos.co.i n
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ANNEXURE.II

FORtv{-tl
(For projects other than linear projects)

Government of Gujarat
. Office of District Collector, Bharuch

No.: toR/wsi ?1-3S 
'---') 

Dated. =f \1\z-.lt
TO WIIOM iQ rT N4AY CONCERN

In cornpliance c'f tire lv'linistrv of Environment and Forests (MoEF), Goverrunent of lerter
No'11-9i98-FCl {pt.) dated 3rd August 2009 rvhere in the IvloEF issued guidelines rights u.nder
tlre scheduled l':ibes and Other Traditional Forest Dwellers (Recognition of Forest Rights Act
2006 (FRA, lor short) on the forest land proposed to be diverted 

-fo, 
non-forest purpose, it is

certified that 187 hectares ol forest land proposed to be diverted in t-avour of behalf of
Gcvernmeut of Gujarat N.w.R.w.S & Kalpasar Depaltment through E>lecutive Engineer, Gulfof Kharnbhat De',elopme:rt Project (W.R.), Project Implementaticn Unit-2, Vadodara for the
Construction of Bhadbhut Barrage, Approach road ancl Flood Protection rvorks across the :iver
Narmada near Village-Aliabet, Taluka : vagra and Utraj village, Taluka : Fiansot, Dist : Bharuch
falls r,vithin the jurisidiction Vagra and Hansot Taluka.

it is further certifled thar:

(a) the complete process tbr identification and settlement of rights unCer the
Fl{A has t'een carried out lor the entire 187 hectares of forest lan,J
proposed lor di''.':rsion. A copy of records of all consultat:on anj
meetings cf the Fcrest Rights comrnittee(s), Gram Sabha(s), S,b-
Division Level Ccmmittee(s) an<J the District Level commlttee ar:
enclosed as annexue to annexure.

(b) the proposal for such diversion of Forest iand for facilities managed b1,
the Government is required under section 3(2) of the FRA have been
completed and the Grarn sabha have given their c-onsent to it;(c) the each c,f concerned Gram Sabha(s). has ceilified that all
formalities/nrocesses under the FRA have been carried olrt, and that
they have glven their consent to trre proposed diversion and the
conlpensation and ameiiorative measures. if any, having uldeistood the
purpose and details cf proposed diversion. A copy of certificate iszued
by the Graru Sabha c,f villages(s) is enclosed as annexure to annexurc

(,J) the discrssion arc decisions on such proposals hac take, place only
u,hen there u,as a quorllm of minimurn 509/o oi the members of Grarn
Sabha present.

(e) the diversion of fc-.est land lor faciiiries nranaged by
required undsr sectior.I 3 (2t of the FRA hal,e been
Gram Sabhas have g:ven their consent to it;

(t) the rights of Primitive Tribal Gror,rps and
the Distric:t Admin:stration, Bharuch where
as per ser:tic,n 3 (1) (e) of the FRA.

Not
Applicable

the Governrr.ent as

completed and the

Pre-Agricultr:ral Corrimunities, as certified b-,-

, applicable have been specificail1, safeguarded

d
(Sandiptfs6gde)
Collector Bharuch
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D. T. VASAVADA, rFs

MEMBER SECRETARY

sErAA (GUJARAT)

tu".? xi_Jr
STATE LET'EL EI\-VIRONMENT

IMPACT ASSESSMENT

AUTHORII-Y
GUJARAT

No. SErAA/GUJ/CRZE3 tzan
$ub: CRZ Clearence frorthe propo.red constructloo of Ea.rags at Viltage: thedbhut, Dist: Eharuch by Narmada, Watcr

fiesources, Water Supply & Kalpasar bepaftmEnt.,,,....,,..,.....,....1n 6RZ Notification, 2011.

Dear Sir,

This has reference lo your application forCRZ clearance along with Form-l dated 23l01n012 seeking CRZ ctearance
submitted to the Forests & Environment Depertrnent (F&ED), Gujarat

fht propotal lt for CRZ Clearanc€ for the proposed construction of Barrage at Vlll|ge: Bhadbhut, Diet; Bharuch
by Narmada, Water Resource$, Water Supply & Kalparar Peparhnent. Total longrth of barrage will bs 1883 meter.

The GCZMA vide their letter dated 2210812017 & 22JO9t2011 had recommended to the SEIAA, Gujarat, t0 grant the CRZ
ClearancE for the above-mention€d project based on its meeting held on'l'l/06/2013, The prrposal was considered by SEIA.A,
Guiarat in its meeting held on 24l08i2017 at Gandhinagar. Afler careful consideration, the SEIAA hereby accords CRZ Clearancp
to above projecl under lhe provisions'of CRZ Notification, 201 1 subject to lhe compliance of lhe following conditions

1

I

The dlverslon offoresl land for prapo88d banage project $hall nol exceed 187 ha.

The NWR&WS&KD shall nol caffy out any aclivily in fonesls area unless thsy obtained clearance u nder FCA, 1 980.
The provisions of ths CRZ notification ol 2A11 shall be slrlctly adhered lo by the NWR&WS&KD, No activity in

contradictlon 1o lhe provisions of the CRZ Notification shall be carried out by the NWR&WS&KD.
Necessary permissions. from different departments/ agenoles under differenl lawe,/ acls shall b€ oblained before
commgndng ony conslruction aclivily including permlssicn under Forests (Conservation) Acl, 1980.

Ihe NWR&WS&KD shall carry out lhe consirustlon acllvities either in the CRZ area or inlo the sea / estuary only afler
having the delailed sludy with respect to chances of erosion / accretion due lo the proposed activities conducted through

ihe NIO or any such reputed organization and shall implement all necessary suggestions / sctlong as may be suggested
by this institute for miilgating the potential negeiive impacts including the checking of erosion and/or aocretif,n in the
region, Further, lhe NWR&WS&KD shall have to ilave the construction drawings approved for this purpose through a

compet6ni agency bofore undertaking any construclion afld/or enabling activities at the site.
The NWR&WS&KD shall have to implemenl the ouloome of the study carried out by the NIO and NIOT on sjltation.
The NWR&WS&KD shall have to eneure that the Jocal people shall not be deprived of their right.
The NWR&WS&KD shell have to ensure thal adequate passages and fieh ladders are provided for movement of boats
of the local fishermen.

The detailed study shall have to be laken by the NWR&WS&KD thouSh the lnslilutes of lhe nalional repute like NIOT
and NIO for erosion on the beth side of the river Narmada in ihe downstr.eam ol the banage.
Ihe NWR&WS&KD shall have lo lake adequate measures to ensure lhat lhere shall not be adverse impact of lhe

4.

proposed structure on Aliyabet and shel, ensure that exisling mangrove$ ar6 protected.

11. The NWR&WS&KD $hell havs to carry out massive plantstion including mangrove plantation in 50 ha of land in

consultation with lhe GEClForests Department and submit an action taken reporl in thjs regard to Forestg and
Environment DeparlmenUMOEF&CC, GOl.

12 All the recomrnendaiions and suggeslions given by the NEERI, Nagpur in their Environment lmpact Assessment and
Risk Assessment reporl shall be implemenled strictly by the NWR&WS&KD.

13. The NWR&WS&KD shall ensure lhat proper Environrnenl flow is always maintain in downstream side of the river
Nannada from thB proposed Bhadbhut barrage.

14. Comprehensive Environrnent lmpact Assessmenl report shali be submitted to thrs departmBnt and the
recommendation$/sugge$tians given in it shall be implemented.

15. The aon$truction debris and sewage generaled during the construc{ion phasa shall not be discharged inlo the creek,
sea, estuary or inlo the CRZ area, Tho dabris shall be removed frorn lhe construction slle irnmediately after lhe

\r construclion ie over and shall be disposed of as per the guidance of the GPCB.

RSffRpfhgglCujarat Pollution Control Board, "Pa4tavaran thavan',Sector-10 A, Candhinagar-382010

DateB'1' 
AU G Zul?,ir,::::

6.

8.

9.

10.

Srqte Level Erivironment Phone No.:- (079) 232-32152,232-41514 Fax No:-(079) 232.2?784

lmpUCt AqflpS.nlCjt AUthOfity F,mqil' msteisaoir2smail rnm lrl/ehci.c'' rururv qaire orriar*r onrr in

,,i,."l*ffiffilffilDoord,
"Pf,ryf,vtrrn phlwln"

.!ur;tor- I 0-A, Grndh inagar- I 0
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isburs thsll b€ !rqvK,e' us\ st
ensurao tl'rsl thc a{h1{oJt'r€ntd

T

H
':ii
' Iir

The constructJon camps shail b€ lorahd outside the CR: aree snd ths c*rlstructlon

nerFssary srneniti€s. rnclr$trE Ssnitstron waler suppir and fuel and tt shsll be

conddlc(s er€ nol detenorated by the consuucirwl laboura

1? The ground$Bier glEll not be t$pgd to rts€t wrth lhe'.rq$w rsq$|wn$$$ dwng esnstruc*E$ or opcrrtrslr pt.!{3o tn S-ly

case

18 The trsdition$l rights of lorsl wrnrnunrhes shq:ll rct 6e r&cmd ln so(t, ttey shstt nS depnv€ of in€ir lmcl}noqd hr til
pr,jrpose ol tfie prolect

19 A oisaster Managenrqnt Ptsn to m€€t wlfi any Bwr{urlib8$ thal rnsy &ns8 d$nng censtmcfXrn 8n&of op$tat}sn ph$
sholl be pr€p8red rmptsmenEd.

?Cl A separate Envrronrnental Cell with quattfied Ferso{ln$ shsll be crBst€d to m]plems{,rt the Envirorrnentsl iianegsmor*

Plan and a sepsrate budget $hs[ b6 provided far thi5 trrrpss€
21 The cost ol th€ oxtemal ageocy that m€y be appsint€d by this departrner( ,!r superursion i monitorirrg of tltc prs@

scirvitios during constructiori, apGrauansl phas€s shall be bsme by the l.lwR&\nlis&KD
22. A large scale socio-economic $pktment pmgram in consultatran v{ith ths Oistrid Colbuortr DDO shaH bs c{rried o.rt A

separate budget shail be prcvided {o. this purpose and dstails b€ furnishBd to tllla D€partm€nf from tanB to lirt}s.

?3. Envrronmental Audit report shall be subrnitted evqry y€sr. Th€ r€port shall abo Eyer $6 ciang& ,n the sosstal and

manne environment due to proposoo prolect

24 A $ix monthly progress report$ regardn0 th$ ctmplianoe of the mrdition$ shall be subrnittod to F&ED, GoG/SEll,A
25 Any additronal conditron th6t may be tmposed by MOEF,GOU F&ED GoC i SEIAA hom timc b tme slall ha$Q !o be

comptied wth by the NWR&\,\rS&KD. .

The constructron dEbns and / or any other type oi wasle I w8te$Hater shsll oot be c,rspced ol into the saa. claek s rn

the CRZ areas. The debris shall be romovod frofi the consirudion site lmm€di8t€ly stsr th€ consnlction E over

It shali be ensured that there is no adverse imp8ct on the drainage of the eree due to tbe w$tru.tton ac*ffiltes

Solid waste likely to be generated tiom construction slte and labour camps dunng conslrudion phsse wtll be collecied

and disposed off as per the Sold Waste Menagement Ruies - tct'16

Vessels op€ratrng during constructlon phass srrch as dredger shall be equipped wrlh spSI respq}s€ htt.
Topsori Bxcavated durrrlg construclion edNities shsil b€ storsd for use in hortrcultural ,i landscap€ d€wloprnsnt wthn
the proj6ct sib.

31. Ready Mix CoficrEte should ba ussd so fgr & pos$tbb, Wdsr d€fiend dudr€ srctrutiion shqJld be r€duced hy u*a of

curing agents, plasticizers,and oth€r best prscti€s
32 The Diesel Generator Set, if to be providsd'during the aonst ucton fihaeG shsll b€ of gtdossd typ€ ard confomng to

the EPA Rules for air *nd noiea emission sisndards.

33, The overall noise l€vst in snd sround ths projoct 8re€ shall be kept r,rs[ vrithin lhe slsndalds by p.oykjing norse con@
mea$ur6$ inctuding $lgineerirE @ntrols on all sourcss of noice genaration. The amHenl nqs$ lovel shall con orm to tfle
stardards pr€scribad undor The Envrronment (Protecrion) Act 1386 & Rul63.

M. Vehlcte8 hir€d for bnr€ing construGlion meteriEl et Bita sholld be in good conditims aM confrorm to app}csbb rir end
.noise ern+ssion standard$ atd $iBuld bd opcrst€d only during nongeah hours.

gS. Fty ash should ba ussd a$ buildrng materiol in the construction m per povisbns of Fly Aeh Notiftcdk n under EPA

36 The waler meter shall be installed ard records o, moflthly watsr consumption shsll b€ mgintsin8d reguisrly

37 Tlr€ domestic vesstswater shall bo disposed off through septic tenk - tsak pit

E@B
38. Ihe fugittve emission in ths work area shall be monitored. Tha erntsgion shsll conform to the stendrr& pGscribod by the

croncerned aullpnlies frorn time to tirne (e,g Diredors of lnduslrial Sahty & Heaith).

@
39 NWR&WS&KD D€psrtrnent shall strictly mmply with ths rul€s and ragulstions vrith Ggsrds to h.rdling anrl dirpos.l ot

Haeardous waste in accsrdanc€ with th€ Haasrdals and Other Wastos (Mrnagprnenl rnd Transbourdory MorGmcnl)

Rules 2016, as may be amendsd from tinE to time. Authorkstion oi thc GPCB must b. obtstnd fo. collectro. r

trsalment I storags / di$posal of hazardous wa.sb8 & other wast68.

40 Hazsrdous wast8B shall b€ drisd, pactsd ard s{orsd in s€p6mte ds$nrted hszsdout wE$. sfor8g€ halrty unsr pr}cca

bottorn and leaohaE collecilon f|cilrty, betore it8 dbp€sl.
41 Oll spdts if any shal be prop€riy colbc;ted and dbposad a6 p€r tls pravailing Rrtlto.

\ .. 42 Neo$sBry errang8m8nE snell bo made {or s*$ dtspGal ot municipcl tolH wst8o ss ps tlE proriri*iors ol tha gohd,

\ Wastes Maoagpmont RLfus. 2016 sa arnendGd fiorn tinr6 to timo .nd ldd Yt'8dra 8h.ll not bo rol6aacd tn mann6 xater
in 8fly cas6.

bo sotd or'ily to S.!c rrlistlrs{, m6,!!5rs^

26

27
1A

29
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44 Any non-hazardous waste shall b€ oisposed off as per the Hazardous and olher vJssles (Management and

Transborrr\oary Movement) Ruies 2016
kft$rr-*-a?

45. Necessary emergency lightrng system along with emergency power back up systern shall be provlded 
-: ^,.^--*a>..

46. Persongl Proteclive Equipments (PPEs) shall be provided to workers and its usage shau be ensured and supervrsed

47 Firsl Aid Boxes shall be provided ln adequate quantity at stralegrc locations

46. Trainrng shall be grven to all workers on safeiy and health aspeots of handling chemrcals

4g Tire prolect managernenl shall prepare a comprehensive Disaster Management Pian (DMP) for the frrolect as per the

' guidelrnes frcm Drrectorate ol lndustriai Safeiy and Health Delailed DMP prepared shall be impiemented to br'ng dov/n

rlsk rnvolved I hazards I accldents as lovr as leasonably practicabie

50 I ranspcilatron of materiais shall b€ as per the fu'lotor Venlcle Act & Rules

51. The proiect management shall ensure to comply wlth;ll tne envlronment pfotection measures' trsk rllitrgallon rneasufes

and safeguards mentioned in the Disaster Managemeni PIan (DMP)

52 Occupational health suNeillanc€ of the V/orkers Shall be done and its records shall be maintalned Pre-employment and

periodical medical examination for all the workers shall be undertaken as per the prevarlrng norms'

53 Tie up shall be done \Nith nearby heatth 
"nr" 

,ni, i lo.ro, to' seekrng irnmediate n'Jdical attentron in the case o{

emergency.
r{8rnfilFE! 

. :,,^, i^ 6hi a^, ,nd rhe orant area shail be kept vrelr wrthrn the prescribed standards by prolid1ng ncise

" :::,,';1"fJ:::j":fi,J.ff'":::# l::'1il:'T:"'": Jil?::':$::::"::: ,::.i:1"':"il i;."'lii;"-' "'

notse generatron The ambient norse levels ti'U-t""i"'t,, tO the Slandards prescrlbed under the Envirc^menl

(protection) ActandRules Workplacenoi"ururet.iorworkersshall beaspertheFactoriesAciandRules

@th5.h5onanrnrdetlenVironmental/CRZc1earancebytheSElAAand*Hffi 
ffi il:" H?:#' [,'i::;;" jJ:ff1 

J il,:",:: :fl i": ;J'Jil :':ff 
' 
* n l' * " 

w;b s 
'.e 

o r s E Mi

.EAC/ GpcB Thls shail be advertised witirin sevl. oays kom the dat'e of the .ieafance letter' in at least t\Yo lccal

ne\,r'spapers that are widely circulated in ttre reg,oi. one of uvnrcrr shall be rn the Guiarati langus-:9 and ihe clher r3

Englrsh A 
"oo, "u"i 

of th"'.ume shail be forwarded to lne cor:aerlBd Reg'onal otfice of lhe I\'1rnistry

56 in the event of farlure of any poltution contror systeri adcpled by the unil the "1t::1 
['e safely closed do'iln and shall

nol be resianed until the desired effrcrency of the control equrpmeni has been achieved

57 Env ronrnenrar Audit report rndicating tt e cnange-s. ii any with respect to th_e baselrne envrtoni'rlental quallty rn the

coastal and marine environment shall be submiited every year by NWR&WS&KD tc F&ED

5B A Separate budget shall be eannarked ro,' 
"."iror*]atia '-ugttnunt 

anc socio-economic activriles rncludrng the

greenbett , ,"nnror" plantation and details ,*r""t'rnriio" ir,tlnnto lo F&ED sElM as well as I\"1oEF Gol The

deiails wrth respecl to expendrture from this r,uogui-h.ua 
'null 

also be furnisheo along wrth comp[ance reporl

59, A separate 
"nui,on.-"ntut 

management cerl *,tn quarrr,eo pelscnnel Shall be Created for environmenlal mcn(onng.anl

management cunng 
"-onatrr"tron-and 

operatronal phases ol lne prolect 
ndrance to movement oi flshrng vessels

60 The project sha{l uJ implemented in such a Tflanner thai there shall be no any nL

or frsherrnen

61.NWR&WS&KDshallbesrthecostoftneexternalagencytnatmayb:aleo].T,edbySEIAAorForeStS&Envrronmenl
Department [F&ED], Gularat for supervision / n.;;;,,; of Proposed actlvltles and the environmental lmpacts ol the

ProPosed activities

62,AnyothercondltlonthatmaybeslipulatedbythesElM/F&EDfromtin.letotlmeforenviron.nen|alproteclloni
manasement o"o:t;';;;i ;i'" 1s 5s s6mptied wrth bv NWR&ws&KD

63 rhe p'o1uct autnolil"i"t*t''o'' adhere to;:';;';;;;*t o"nt Gu,arat Porlution control Board (GpcB)'

., ::n:l*:sil:::';,,I:fi'.:r#!:lll,**.,['::ilr::',il::il.".a 
mpac'1s'nn' *:,'": 'u'i 

w"\'ur

" *:[{: ril*lrlr 
**161ii[:'T;1''FI!-'ij::,*'"' 

(Preven'iion & con'lror o{ Po uioni

Acr.i974, nil. tpr.J.nrion & Control oi porirtionii"t, .1;;;' ;;;t'tonmeillProteclion) 
Act' 1986' the Hazardous and

otherwasteslManagementandTrans0ound';ii';'--;tl';las20l6andihePubiicLiabilitylnsuranceAcll99l
along vilth therr amendments and rules

66 The cornpany ,rr, ;;;r;;;ocio-economrc developmental / commtrnly welfare activities as p€I the csR Rules 2014

67 The p..o,u"t ,utnonti-uJ.n.rr .r*r* ,ouo'"t" t"'"i"'"'o *o'u'unt th: co:dJlons stipulated by sElM as well as GPCB

along with tne ,mpiementation sc^hedule "' 
t'1"'"" """iiloni 

stipurateo herern The funds so provrded shall nct be

diverted for anY other PUrPose'

68 rhe prorect proponen,,ll1:':,1.T:11.*.';;;:'J::l::Hfl:[:i:il?,l"i H:ii:i::l' '*" 
or the sEroo 0r

, jt if :l;5"Jj;[",ffi I[ifi:'?# H,il:"';i #;il.m a ntar protect on a nd ma n aqement

\-t "Y"'"-- 
=----rt - ' ' r:r

;;i;. i:;;..'''l: l'T::1il;
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69. lt shalr rle mandatory for the prolect management to submit harf-yearry compriance report in .especit of rhe stipr.iraled

CRZ clearance torms and conditions in hard and soft copies to the reguiatory authority concernsd, s6 1'r June an5 1r
Decernber of each calendar year.

70 concealing factual data or submission of false/fabricated data and failure to comply wrth any of the conditions menlrcnec

6bove may result in withdrawal of this clearance and attract action under the provisions of Environment (Prolectionl Act.

I YOU

71 Theprojectauthontiesshall alsoadheretothestipulationsmadebytheGuiaratPollutionConkol Board.
72 The SEIAA may revoko or suspend the clearance, if implemenlation of any of the above conditions is not found

sat'SfaclOry
73, The company in a time bound manner shall lmplement these conditions. The SEIAA reserves the nght to strpulale

additlonal conditions, if the same is found necessary.
74 The pft),ect authorities shall inform the GPCB, Regional Office of MoEF and SEIAA about the date of Rnancial closurt

and tinal approval of the project by the concerned authonties and the date of start ofthe project.
75 Th's CRZ clearance is valid for seven years from the dale of issue.

76 Any appeal against this CRZ clearance shall lie with the National Green Tribunal, if preferred. vrithin a period of 30 dayg

as prescribed under Section 16 of the National Green Tribunal Act, 2010.
77 Submission of any false or misleading inforrnation or dala which is material to screening or scrping or appraisal or

decrsion on th€ appljcation makes this environment/CRZ clearance canc€lled.

..:

,:.rf:

ti:li,l

t:tr
j"^

:'

ti

'i

Wilh regards,
Yours srncerely,

\-
udfffiavrort

Member Secretary

IITEI}IBER SECRETAITY
Ststc Level fi qliruunrrnt

!mpuct Asss$snr. nt,{utiorlty
(SEItA " {i.rjarnt)

Gujurrt Potfliqpl tinlroi Boarrl,
" Pa ry atqlgll-n-Dlf'a we n',

Scrtor- I 0-A, Grndhlnsgnr- I 0

lssued to:
The Secretary,
Narmada, Water Resources,
Water Supply and Kalpsar Department'

Block No. 8, 7th Floor, Sardar Bhavan,

SachivalaYa, Gandhinagar' 38201 0
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Government
of lndia
E- Pcrtal

4
I Name of Regional Office Bhopal

/-
SiateiDistrict/Forest Division io whtct the
proposal relates Gujarat

J Name of User Agency, lrlature of proposal
Executive

Engineer,Gulf of
Khambhat

4 Extend of Forest area involved 187 Ha,
f lVhether original, or extens]on Orignal

6
lf extension of lease, pl clarify if proposal
involves additional forest area, and if so,
specify

7 Date of 1st stage clearance 21-12-2A17
U Extend of CAMPA charges, head wise via

(a) Compensatory Afforestation 5,80,91 ,3241

(b) Additional CA

O Penal CA

(d) Catchment Area Treatment

(e ) Witdlife Managernent plan

(f) Additional charges for diversion of area
falling under nitified/protected areas

(g) Net present Value 16,58,69,000/-

(h) Any other Chargesllevies (pl specify)

Total for Government of India 22,39,6a,3241-

Demand Note For E-Portal

ANNEx u rg-y

* Kindiy Go to E- Portai and fill up the amount

S s:-ir -Ir i iri si l: *i - Iik e;u.ci:.
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Llndertaking to Pay the additional amount of Net present Value (Npv)

Certified that the applicant i.e. Government of Gujarat, l(alpasar Department

under the jurisdiction of its Gujarat area, agrees to mal<e payment of the aclciitional

atttoultt of Net Present Value (NPV) to the Forest Departnrent, if so deternrined, iis ller

the t-rnal decision of the [{on'ble Suprenre Court o1-lnciia over the petyrrent of'the l\PV

made at the then prevaiiing rare.

w-
Deputy Executive Engineer

tt
-PExecutive Ehgineer

Gulf of Khambhat Development Project (W.R) Gulf of l(hambhat Development Project (W R)

Project I mplernentation U nit-2
Vadodara

Project lmplementation Unit-2
Vadodara



ANNEXU(E_:W

Statement showing the details of Boundry Stone of Diverted Forest Land for
Bhadbhut Barrage as per Condition No.l6 of Stage - I Clearance

STATION
LATITUDE

(N)
LONGITUDE

(E)
FORE

BEARING
BACK

BEARING
LINE

DISTANCB
(M)

SURVEY NUMBER 1 OF ALIABET
A 21038'56.11 J2048',10.59" 73"Z',2 2530z',2 ATOB 61.68
B 2 o38',56.72" 72"48',12.63" 6905'10" 249"5',10" BTOC 299.75

C 21 '39'0.33 72"48',22.31 63029',56" 243'29',56 CTOD r01.15

D 21039',6.30" 72048'34.70" 59073',24" 239013',24" DTOE 420.17
E 21039',73.47" 72'48',47.15 155059',26" 335"59',26" ETOF 37t.11
F 2103g',2.51.', 72'48'52.56 250"32',50" 70'32',50" FTOG 249.23

G 2 o3 8'59.73 " 72048',44.42" 259024',55* 79024',55" GTOH 201.43

H 2 "38'58.42" 72"48',37.58" 264"57',27" 84"57',27" HTOI r01..92

I 2 o3 8'5 8.08" 72048',34.05" 250043'8" 70"43',8" ITOJ 299.82

J 2 o3 8'54.73 " 72"48',24.25" 244"LL',44" 6401l',44" JTOK 303.24

K 2 o3 8'50.30" 72048',74.83" 162048',46" 342048',46" KTOL 2294.46

L 2 "37'39.37" 72"48'39.46" 252"28',28" 72028',28" LTOM 59.77

M 2 o37',38.77" 72"48',37.50" 342"46',47" 762"46',47" MTON 2441.66

N 2 o3 
8',5 3,02" 72048',11.66 248046',24" 68046',24', NTOO 499.92

o 2 o38',46.92" 72017'55.55" 343071',29" l630ll'29" OTOP 100.28

P 2 o3 8'50.01 " 72047',54.47', 68046',24" 248046',24" PTOA 499.92

SURVEY NUMBER 379 OF UTARAJ
o 21o39'32.20" 72049'14.30" 60037',15* 24001'6" QTOR 792.68

R 270 39', 45.2" 72" 49',38.1" 39030'28" 219030',28" RTOS 147.76

S ? 10 39' 49.0" 72" 49', 41.3" 64"4',12" 24404',12', STOT " 306.19

T 21" 39', 53.5" 72" 49',50,8', 6502l',28" 245"21',28" TTOU 312.05

U 21" 39', 57,8" 72" 50'0.6" 104"24',55" 284024',55" UTOV 293.23

V 21" 39'55.6" 72" 50 10.5" 1q8"42',47" 18"42',4'/" VTOW 1084.49

w 27" 39',22.0" 72" 49',58.9" 243"39'8" 63"39'8" WTOX 437.03

x 2lo 39',15.5" 72" 49', 45,1" 254"46',21" 74"46',21" XTOY 727.3r

Y .210 39' 09.0" 120 49', 21.\', 345030',55 " 165030'55" YTOQ 739.01

\,,-u
uf[V-e'l'.n

\Jgurt]-_
Deprrtl fffiLrtive [ngirtecr

Project Implementation Unit-2
Vadodara

Exec glnee

Proj ect Implementation Unir2
Vadodara

E:\BB LAQ\Forest\Forest Land Boundary stone DATA BB187Ha-28112018


