
Diversion  of  1.540  ha  (34100  Mtr)  forest  land  for  laying
underground  OFC  by  Telesonic  Network  Ltd.  4th  floor,  C-wing
Airtel  Centre  Plot  16,  Udyog  Vihar  IV,  Gurugram-1220015,
Haryana  Starting  From  our  Tower  (HAZ001,  Hazipur
Lat/Long.31.97403/75.75347) Near stone 14/500 on Mukerian-
Talwara Road towards brother sweet shop ( One another Route
istowards village Gera (900 Mtr) from Main OFC Route to connect
tower) to Gurudwara Bhatha Sahib to HP Petrol Pump to CE/BEAS
Dam, BBMB Talwara turn right towards (Anothers OFC Towards
Main Market Chowk and left turn towards Police Station Talwara
to  wards  Ana  TV  Reparing  Shop  than  Left  till  IVY  Hospital
Talwara) (100 Mtr) Kesri Hotel to CERA Sanitary Ware again turn
right towards Karan bike gallery towards Bhamotar village road
crossing to Gautam eye hospital to bhol Kolata village opp Preet
Petroleum to Thakur Dhaba to Govt. Sr. Sec School, Ramgarh Sikri
to Laxmi electronic and turn right ( Mill stone 41/200) towards
Bhambhor village from LAT/Long 31.95453/75.82740 near Ms 22
towards  Rouli  village  to  our  tower  Rali  20  (1150  Mtr)  from
Lat/long.  31.89405/7592030  turn  towards  Gurudwara  Bringli
Sahib till  our  tower at Bringali  village ( 3200 mtr) total  Route
Length  34100  Mtr  in  Tehsil  &  Forest  division  Dasuya  Distt.
Hoshiarpur, (FP/PB/OFC/155919/2022). 
 

PART IV
                                    

(To be filled in by the Nodal Officer or Principal Chief Conservator   
of Forests or Head of Forest Department)

 
17.    Recommendation of the State Government:
                                     
Detailed opinion and specific recommendations of State
Forest Department  for acceptance or otherwise of the
proposal   with   remarks.   (While   giving   opinion,   the
adverse comments made by concerned Conservator of
Forests   or   Deputy   Conservator   of   Forests   Should   be
categorically reviewed and critically commented upon).

 Recommended
for Approval

 
Basanta Raj Kumar 

NODAL OFFICER (FCA)
21/11/2022
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